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Lannan, Kathleen L

From: E.W. Yost Company

Sent:  Monday, July 30, 2001 11:04 AM
To: Lannan, Kathleen L

Subject: Re: DAAE20-00-D-0077 0002

Kathy:

We will take the $500.00 consideration on the recoil mechanisms based on the delivery
extension to August 22, 2001.

Thank you.

Valerie A. Smith

Director of Administration

----- Original Message -----

From: Lannan, Kathieen L

To: EW Yost (E-mail)

Cc: Lannan, Kathieen L

Sent: Monday, July 30, 2001 11:40 AM
Subject: FW: DAAE20-00-D-0077 0002

I need a response to this so that | can get the revised delivery schedule processed. Thank you.

Kathleen L. Lannan

Contract Specialist
AMSTA-LC-CSC-B

309-782-6444

fax: 309-782-1906

email: lannank@ria.army.mil

From: Lannan, Kathleen L

Sent: Friday, July 27, 2001 8:47 AM
To: 'E.W. Yost Company’

Cc: Lannan, Kathleen L

Subject: RE: DAAE20-00-D-0077 0002

$500 is the cost of processing the modification nowdays. Inflation catches up with everything sooner or later as
you in the business world understand.

Kathleen L. Lannan

Contract Specialist
AMSTA-LC-CSC-B

309-782-6444

fax: 309-782-1906

email: lannank@ria.army.mil

07/30/2001
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From: E.W. Yost Company [mailto:yost@worldnet.att.net]
Sent: Friday, July 27, 2001 8:37 AM

To: Kathy Lannan

Subject: DAAE20-00-D-0077 0002

Kathy:

As per your request, we are submitting a request for an extension on contract
#DAAE20-00-D-0077 0002. We will deliver the balance of these recoil mechanisms
by August 22, 2001. We apologize for the delay and will take a consideration of
$250.00 from the original contract price.

If you have any questions or require further information, please contact us at 215-699-
4868.

Thank you.

E.W. Yost Company
P.O. Box 5093
Center Square, Pa 19422

Phone: 215-699-4868
Fax: 215-699-0195

Cage Code: 8H739

Email: yost@worldnet.att.net

07/30/2001



